SOUTHWEST PUMPSTATION FOR THE CITY OF ST. MARYS

BID TAB

Date: October 6, 2011

CONTRACTOR

CONTRACT A
General & Mechanical

CONTRACT B
Electrical

COMBINED A & B

Winelco, Inc.
6141 Centre Park Drive
West Chester, OH 45069

$763,000.00

no bid

n/a

Peterson Construction

18817 S.R. 501 N.

Box 2058

Wapakoneta, OH 45895-0558

$852,000.00

$310,000.00

deduct $100,000.00
$1,062,000.00

Sidney Electric
840 S. Vandermark Road
Sidney, OH 45365

no bid

$365,530.00

n/a

Shinn Brothers
540 Summit Street
Celina, Ohio 45822

$945,000.00

no bid

n/a

Buschur Electric
305 W. First St.
Minster, OH 45865

no bid

$278,925.00

n/a

Jutte Excavating
1140 Ft. Recovery Minster Rd.
Ft. Recovery, Ohio 45846

$796,600.00

no bid

n/a

R. G. Zachrich Construction
10105 Haller St.
Defiance, OH 43512

$822,449.00

no bid

n/a

Miller Contracting Group
P.O. Box 162
Ottoville, OH 45876

$872,000.00

no bid

n/a

Tom's Construction, Inc.
821 Cooper Drive
St. Henry, Ohio 45883

$832,868.00

no bid

n/a

Engineers Estimate

$1,013,000.00

$307,000.00

$1,320,000.00




